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Dare To Be Youth Charity Launches Groundbreaking 'Leader Within Program' to Empower 
Youth Leadership in Halton/Hamilton Region 

 

Burlington, ON – Dare To Be Youth Charity, a leading advocate for youth development, is thrilled 
to introduce its innovative 'Leader Within Program,' designed to empower young individuals in 
the community through practical educational seminars, personal development activities, and 
engaging discussions. 

 

The 'Leader Within Program' 2024 is specifically tailored for young people aged 14-24, aiming to 
equip them with the skills and mindset needed to become confident leaders. Participants will 
have the opportunity to boost their self-esteem, develop essential life skills, and establish 
meaningful connections within their community. 

 

PROGRAM HIGHLIGHTS: 

 

Practical Educational Seminars: Expert-led sessions providing valuable insights to navigate 
challenges and opportunities. 
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Personal Development Activities: Engaging exercises promoting personal growth, self-
discovery, and essential leadership qualities. 

 

Community Peer Support: Participants become part of a supportive community fostering 
collaboration, shared learning, and networking opportunities. 

 

Dignity and Safety: DTBY is committed to ensuring the dignity and safety of every participant, 
providing a secure space for free expression, trust, and respect. 

 

REGISTRATION INFORMATION: 

 

Interested individuals are invited to register for the 'Leader Within Program' by February 1st, 
2024. Don't miss this chance to invest in your personal and leadership development. 

To register and learn more about the program, please visit: 
(https://www.dtby.ca/programs/leader-within/)  

 

DTBY is driven by the belief that investing in the potential of today's youth shapes a brighter, 
more inclusive, and resilient future for tomorrow's leaders. We firmly stand behind the notion 
that unity within our communities is the cornerstone of collective growth and well-being. 

We envision a future community where all youth are resilient and empowered to make an 
authentic impact. 

 

For media inquiries, please contact: 

Nicole Kenny, Director of Programs 

Email: nicole@dtby.ca  

 

About Dare To Be Youth Charity (DTBY): 

DTBY is a Burlington-based non-profit organization dedicated to empowering youth through 
educational initiatives, community engagement, and leadership development programs. With a 
mission to inspire 14–24-year-olds to build life skills and develop healthy community 
connections, the organization has been a driving force in fostering positive change and nurturing 
the potential of the next generation. 


